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COASTAL WINES OF SOUTH AFRICA

WHITE WINES
Pinehurst (Moreson Estate)

Chenin Blanc 2004-12.5%.Hints of guava on the nose, easy 
drinking wine which can be enjoyed on its own or with salads. - 
W.O. Coastal- Franschoek. £6.25

Chardonnay 2004 Unwooded- approachable style of this 
occasionally difficult unoaked style. Light and fresh, tropical nose 
with buttery hints,leaving vanilla on the aftertaste.13.5% £7.25

Raka Stanford

Sauvignon Blanc 2004- Grassy, Green peppers and asparagus 
flavours,a fresh and lively wine with time on its side.12.5% alc. 
£7.95

Rosé 2004     
Made from 18% Sangiovese and 82% extracted juice. The 
Sangiovese spend one month in French oak. A delightful nose of 
strawberries and rose petals with a slight lemon palate and a long 
elegant finish. Dry (1.91g/1 sugar)  £6.25



   

RED WINES
Pinehurst (Moreson Estate)
Cab Sauv 2001- Michealangelo International Award Gold Medal 
winner, packed with sweet black fruits, eucalyptus spices and a 
rich,long finish.14%, 14 months on oak. £9.50

Raka 
Pinotage 2004- Full bodied dark colour, banana nose with a spicy 
welcome but a long lingering smooth aftertaste. 14.5%. ABSA Top 
10 Pinotage 2005.  £9.85

Spliced 2003-A blend of mainly Cabernet and Ruby Cabernet, with 
Shiraz and Merlot, and a splash of Petit Verdot. Herbaceous nose 
with a palate of ripe cherries, chocolate and smokiness- 
delicious!ALC: 14%  £9.25

Awards: Fairbairn Capital Wine show Bronze Medal 
3 and a half stars Wine Magazine

Stark

Coastal Shiraz 2002-Jose Conde’s very excited by his first Shiraz 
release. Dominant plum and red-berry fruit flavours with the 
characteristic tar and spice giving support in the background. Quite 
bold, but not over-the-top. 8000 bottles made.ALC: 14.5% £15.75

Platter Guide 2005 – 4 Stars

1 of everything and double up on any other 5, special tasting price £95.00- save up to £25


